
House in Cártama

Bedrooms 4 Bathrooms 2 Built 320m2 Plot 5000m2 

R4745764 House Cártama 720.000€

An Oasis in Cártama: Where Life Blossoms Welcome to my home! I am a charming single-
family residence located in the picturesque area of Cártama, spread over a generous plot of 
5,000 square meters. Here, rural life and modern comfort meet in perfect harmony. With a 
built-up area of 320 square meters, my interior space is designed for comfort and livability. 
My three bedrooms offer a cozy refuge, while my spacious living room and large kitchen are 
perfect for family gatherings and special moments. The warmth of my two fireplaces, one in 
the living room and another in the kitchen, adds a touch of rustic charm, creating a cozy 
atmosphere throughout the year. And let&apos;s not forget my full bathroom, ideal for 
relaxing after a long day. Climb up to the top and you&apos;ll find an independent apartment 
that will steal your heart. With a spacious living room, a large bedroom, and a full bathroom, 
it&apos;s the perfect place for guests or to enjoy a bit of additional privacy. My exterior is as 
impressive as my interior. I am fenced with an automatic gate, ensuring your safety and 
privacy. Enjoy the outdoors on my three large porches, one of them equipped with a 
barbecue for your outdoor parties. Relax in my well-maintained garden, take a dip in my pool, 
and let your vehicles rest in my two covered garage spaces and six uncovered ones. 
Additionally, I have two water tanks that store up to 25,000 liters, ensuring you never run out 
of water, even on the hottest days. The land surrounding me is filled with olive trees and 
various fruit trees, offering you the opportunity to enjoy your own fresh harvest. Imagine 



picking your own fruit each season, a delight for the senses and a luxury few can offer. Living 
in Cártama is not only a pleasure because of my splendid construction but also because of 
the natural beauty that surrounds us. This place offers a tranquil environment and a friendly 
community, perfect for establishing your home. Do not miss this unique opportunity to live in a 
home that truly speaks for itself. Contact us today and come see the house that could 
become your next home. I am waiting to welcome you! I am one of "the houses that speaks 
for itself," ready to offer you a lifestyle that combines the best of nature and modern comfort. 
What are you waiting for to come and visit me?

Barbeque Barbeque Fitted Wardrobes

Guest Apartment Private Terrace

+34 952 939 460 · info@allinrealestates.com
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